Berlin, Bob oo 1.0 000
UL * U Lo
From: holdem@charter.net
Sent: Sunday, November 20, 2005 7:26 PM Miasouri Public
To: opeservice@ded. mo.gov; thyme@ameran.com:, wiatro@ameren.d8airvice Cormmission
bob.berlin@psc.mo.gov; sarah.fontaine@psc.mo.gov; GenCounsel@psc. mo.gov
Subject: [Fwd: re: 111 e pitman, o'fatlon, Missouri]
>
> From: "micheile meyer" <tanus 35@hotmail.coms> |
> Date: 2005/11/20 Sun PM 07:54:35 EST Exhibit No. Y|
> Tc: heldem@charter.net Case NO(S) t‘(““ Q\OO /-E)‘
Subject: re: 111 e pitman, o'fallon, Missouri
o mubdee prEman © Date \\ -2\~ O§Hptr o
= Dear mr. byrne,
>
> Hello. My name is Billie Meyer. I resided at 11 east pitman with mr.
> andersson. i was his girlifriend at that time. we rented this home and
> had several others living there with us. i spoke with amerenue and an
> attorney for them. i attempted to take responsibility for this bill and they refused.
> gaying since i didn't have a current agcount te transfer the balance
» tc, 1 couldn't assume this bill.
>
i am currently waiting on a lawsuit settlement which should be settled
by the end of feburary, hopefully, and as i gtated befoer, will be
paying this bill in full at that time.

i don't know how Damon ended up being the regponsible party for this

ill but as your statement attached says, he was also using the

electric. so was i. therefore, 1 am also a responsible party. Damon

had been paying all bills for both of us and was supporting me at the

time, therefore, i will be paying this bill and am wanting the

responsbility of paying it but for some reason, everyone has declined my request.

as far as small claims court is concerned, we have noc recourse on
those individuals living there at the time because we have no idea
where they are or how to reach them. Damon should not be held
responsible, i should be and am yet again, reguesting this be so.

i am currently at 168 blue fountain, festus, missouri 63028

(636) 533-9299

1 am currently waiting for my disablility to be approved as well. if i

get that approved, i will also be able tc start making payments con this bill.
however, 1 have no account number to do so with. all i have is Damon's

name and the address.

i hope that you will understand our situation and can appreciate that
i am willing to take the responsibility on myself. please contact me
as soon as possible regarding this matter and algc make it matter of
record that i have requested this bill be my responsibility.

thank you for your prompt attention to this matter and i look forward
to speaking with you at your earliest convenience about this. we are
anxious to settle this matrer.

Sinceresly,
Billie Meyer

Express yourself instantly with MSN Messenger! Download today - it's FREE!
http://meszenger . msn.click-url.com/go/onm00200471ave/dirvect/01/
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